Cause No. D-1-GV-10-000454

STATE OF TEXAS, IN THE DISTRICT COURT Plaintiff, v. RETIREMENT VALUE, LLC, RICHARD H. "DICK" GRAY, HILL COUNTRY FUNDING, LLC. a Texas Limited Liability Company, TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS HILL COUNTRY FUNDING, a Nevada Limited Liability Company, and WENDY ROGERS, Defendants. and KIESLING, PORTER, KIESLING, & FREE, P.C., 126TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT Relief Defendant.

OBJECTIONS TO SECOND APPLICATION FOR FEES BY THE RECEIVER'S COUNSEL

TO THE HONORABLE JUDGE PRESIDING:

RICHARD H. "DICK" GNAY and WENDY ROGERS, defendants herein, file their Objections to Second Application for Fees by the Receiver and Receiver's Counsel, respectfully showing the Court the following:

I.

The Temporary Receiver appears to have assumed responsibility for pursuing the claims against Defendants Richard Gray and Wendy Rogers. Defendants submit that this is not a prudent use of Retirement Value's assets. The claims against Defendants were filed by the Attorney General, not the Receiver. The Attorney General's office likely has the staff and other resources to prosecute these claims. But even if it does not, the Receiver should insist that the

Attorney General bear the Receiver's cost of pursuing these claims rather shifting that cost to Retirement Value's investors.

Π.

Defendants renew their objection to the Application because it does not specify the source of payment for the fees and expenses requested. Defendants object to the appropriation of funds which should be removed from the Receivership Estate, as set to the Defendants' Objections to First Application of Fees by the Receiver and Receiver's Counsel.

III.

The Receiver has incurred fees for attending to issues arising out of his seizure of the personal bank accounts of Wendy and Jeff Rogers, including fees for negotiating a monthly living allowance for Mrs. Rogers and an order establishing a fund for her legal defense. For the reasons stated in Wendy Rogers' Motion to Roll-are Funds from the Receiver's Control, which are incorporated here, the Receiver lacked authority to seize Mrs. Rogers' assets. Any fees relating to that seizure accordingly should be disallowed. Defendants have identified the specific entries to which they object in Exhibit 1.

WHEREFORE, premises considered, defendants pray their Objections be heard and sustained, and that the Court enter appropriate orders.

Respectfully submitted,

CLARK, THOMAS & WINTERS, A Professional Corporation

 $\mathbf{R}_{\mathbf{W}}$

CHRISTOPHER B. BRADFORD

State Bar No. 00783700

cbb@ctw.com

WILLIAM P. JOHNSON

State Bar No. 24002367

wpj@ctw.com

BARRY K. BISHOP State Bar No. 02346000 300 West 6th Street, Ste. 1500 P. O. Box 1148 Austin, Texas 78767-1148 (512) 472-8800 (512) 474-1129 fax

DEFENDANCE OF THE STATE OF THE ATTORNEYS FOR DEFENDANTS RICHARD H. "DICK" GRAY AND

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on the 30th day of November, 2010, a true and correct copy of the foregoing was been sent to the following electronically via eFiling for Courts and/or facsiru. e.

Attorneys for Plaintiff:
Jack Hohengarten
Charles B. McDonald
Financial Litigation Division
ATTORNEY GENERAL OF TEXAS
300 W. 15th Street, 6th Flr.
P.O. Box 12548
Austin TX 78711-2548
jack.hohengarten@oag.state.tx.us
charles.mcdonald@oag.state.tx.us

Attorneys for Relief Defendant
Kiesling Porter:
Matthew G. Nielsen
Spencer C. Barasch
ANDREWS KURTH, LLP
1717 Main Street, Ste. 3700
Dallas TX 75201
matthewnielsen@andrewskurth.com
sbarasch@andrewskurth.com

Attorneys for Intervenors

Grant W. and Opal E. Bejcek:
Patrick S. Richter

Shannon, Gracey

98 San Jacinto Blvd., S.c. 300

Austin TX 78701-/245

prichter@shannongracey.com

Sam Rosen

Shannon, Gracey

777 Main Steet, Ste. 3800

Fort Wort TX 76102

817-333-3735 fax

srosen(2) Shannongracey.com

Attorneys for Receiver of Retirement Value, LLC:
Michael Napoli
K&L GATES, LLP
1717 Main Street, S² 2800
Dallas TX 75201
michael.napoli@kigates.com

Attorneys & Intervenors
Dr. G Can. B. Edelstein and
Qvest V. Master Fund, LLC:
Ter y Starborough
Geothrey D. Weisbart
MANCE SCARBOROUGH, LLP
11 Congress Avenue, Ste. 500
Austin TX 78701
tscarborough@hslawmail.com
gweisbart@hslawmail.com

Christopher B. Bradford

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gatos tip 1717 Main Street Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

т 214.939.5500

www.klgutes.com

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DO NOT DISCLOSE

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

f eptember 16, 2010 invoice: 2255980

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RECORDED AS OF 08/31 10:

Matter: 1203981.00001

Matter Description: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, e., 31.

Date	Attorney	Hours	Amount	Des riplion
7/19/10	Espinosa, E. S.	0.20	64.00	Cor. spond with M. Hadaway and C. Budner
				1. Tarding RV billing.
8/2/10	Brown, A. G.	3.00	543.00	n eview and organize incoming documentation from investors and update index of same; conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors and their
			Co	agents; revise mailing list and e-mail distribution list in prepare for letter to investors regarding web
				presentation on case status;
8/2/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.30	92.31	Left message for IRS Agent regarding sending documents to him that were provided/produced by Wendy Rogers; e-mails to/from M Napoli regarding
		01		same; e-mail to Wendy Roger's counsel regarding same
8/2/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.70	1,824.00	Review D. Gray's itemized expense report; correspond
0121TV	2007		·	with M. Napoli regarding sales fact access/data; consult with A. Merrick regarding COO/COB and JSS premium; respond to M. Kaye's inquiry; telephone conference with R. James regarding Initial Report, Hess Report and JSS policies; Review pending A/P and new correspondence; review engagement letter for Receivership professionals; review H. Kennedy's changes to Roger's proposed order
8/2/10	Japoli, M. D.	8.30	3,755.75	Teleconference with K Kennedy regarding claims against third parties, Kiesling and C Gray; teleconference with K Kennedy regarding Rogers budget and Rule 11; review correspondence from K Kennedy regarding Rogers budget and proposed order; prepare for and attend teleconference with B Bishop and K Kennedy regarding HCF and Gray; research and analysis of claims against licensees; analyze Gray financial accounting

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 2 September 16, 2010 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u> 8/3/10	Attorney Brown, A. G.	<u>Hours</u> 4.60	Amount 832.60	Description Review and organize incoming documents ion from investors and update index of same; oc., oct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors and their agents; finalize letter to investor and prepare for mailing; organize and supervisors as smailing to
8/3/10	Cunningham, E.	0.70	171.05	investors Strategize regarding unem, 1 ment contribution rate letter from New Jersey; C aft e-mail to Eddy Espinosa regarding the same; regarding unemployment documents regarding Wendy Poers, telephone conferences with the Texas Work proc Commission regarding unemployment for wendy Rogers; draft e-mails to Michael Napour regarding Wendy Rogers' unemployment application.
8/3/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.30	92.31	Left follow up message for IRS agent regarding Wend Reger's production of documents to IRS; receipt and consideration of voice message from IRS regarding same; dictate transmittal letter to IRS Agent en losing documents Wendy Roger's designated as to produced
8/3/10	Espinosa, E. S.	4.30	1,376.00	Correspond with G. Quinones regarding website development; Consult with A. Merrick, A. Arnold and J. Swanson regarding change of ownership, change of beneficiaries and contact administration; Consult with E. Cunningham regarding NY unemployment rates; Consult with M. Napoli, K. Kennedy and J. Jackson regarding Rogers assets; Correspond with E. Koch @ Am. Gen'l Life; review letter to investors, Telephone conference with P. Bowes regarding final account balance.
8/3/10	Napoli, M. D.	5.80	2,624.50	Review W Rogers real property records; review and analyze budget; teleconferences and e-mail correspondence with K Kennedy regarding Rogers budget and Rule 11; legal research regarding claims against licensees; review licensee agreements for potential claims; teleconference with G. Weisbart; correspondence with A King of BBNA regarding account searches; continue review Gray financials; prepare correspondence to investors; confer with E Espinosa regarding Rogers and BBVA issues; prepare
P(1/4/8	Brown, A. G.	5.00	905.00	response to Rogers budget request Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors and their agents; update website with Receiver's Report and web cast information; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft e-mail responses to investor requests for

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 3 September 16, 2013 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	Description information
8/4/10	Cunningham, E.	0.80	195.48	Review EEOC charge filed by Tracy Miss; draft e-mails to Michael Napoli and Edd, Espinosa regarding the same; strategize with Michael Napoli regarding response to EEOC charge and issues regarding Wendy Rogers' unemployment benefits.
8/4/10	Dotson, J. R.	2.90	892.33	Receipt and consideration of Retirement Value mail at its offices and P.O. Boy; I into upkeep of Retirement Value offices; updating, policy premium status chart; email to E Espinos, regarding same and Retirement Value mail
8/4/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.80	2,176.00	RV Receiversh, presentation and preparation; consult with A. Me. ick regarding new LE's; correspond with J. Lee at I & regarding same; consult with A. Brown regarding staffing needs; meet with G. Quinones regarding trevised website, review template and modify content, consult with M. Napoli regarding C. Bebel; I VILW T. Moss' EEOC filings; consult with A. Brown regarding S. Wilhelm and review investment history; eview August projections with A. Merrick; review Wells Fargo fund transfer protocols; review modification to the Rogers Agreed Order regarding
8/4/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.20	3,250.00	legal fees Confer with E Espinosa regarding life expectancies for portfolio; e-mail correspondence with B Bishop regarding substitution of counsel; teleconference with J. Gillum regarding W Rogers budget, confidentiality and retainer; revise proposed order regarding attorney's fees; revise outline for interview; correspondence with J Dotson regarding interview; review EBOC charge by Tracy Moss; review determination letter from TWC regarding W Rogers; confer with E Cunningham regarding Rogers unemployment and defense/next steps on Moss charge; e-mail correspondence with G Weisbart regarding initial report; analysis of offer by C Bebel to resolve fees claim; confer with E Espinosa regarding Bebel claim; e-mail correspondence with K Kennedy regarding Bebel claim; confer with E Espinosa regarding Moss claim; prepare e-mail correspondence to J Gillum and K Kennedy; research and preparation of claims against licensees
8/. /10	Brown, A. G.	4.70	850.70	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

	Pag., 4
September	16, 200
Invoice:	2255980

Data	Attomor	Hours	Amount	<u>Description</u>
<u>Date</u> 8/5/10	Attorney Cunningham, E.	0.50	122.18	Telephone conference with the Texas v rkforce
GI DI 10	Cummenam, D.	0.50	122.10	Commission regarding child care and unemployment
				benefits issue; draft e-mail to Michael Napoli
				summarizing the same; telepho is call to the EBOC
				regarding Tracy Moss's EFO Cuarge.
8/5/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.20	No Charge	E-mails to/from M Napoli regarding scheduling
0/5/10	Domon, 5. 10	0.20	i to Charge	interview with
8/5/10	Espinosa, E. S.	8.20	2,624.00	Telephone conference with G. Quinones to review
0,0,10	Dopinoou, D. C.	0.20	2,020	revised website; Chascheck review; correspond and
				consult with G. Q. inches and R. Meglioriso regarding
				website upgra ie; coordinate wire to ASG; consult with
				A, Merrick regarding COO/COB forms; consult with
				M. Napoli 1 gerding W. Rogers legal fees/claim with
				TWC, an the Hess report; review correspondence
				from V. 1 ennedy regarding Bebel's fees; correspond
				with 3. Rose regarding form "uploads"; review file of
				ar a correspond with (investor); review HCF
				crrespondence; update E. Perez's information;
				correspond with P. Dennis regarding fund transfer;
				email policy notices to A. Merrick; telephone
			•	conference with D. Barent at IRS regarding EIN
			_0	confirmation; file Form 56 with IRS; mail W-9 to OM
				Financial; correspond with J. Lee at Lewis & Ellis;
				correspond with A. Garcia regarding his client's file;
			6	correspond with C. Bobick; consult with A. Merrick
				regarding LE certificate to ISC contract
8/5/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.30	3,755.75	Teleconference with K Kennedy regarding Rogers
	- ·	.0		budget and fee issues; confer with E Espinosa
				regarding same; confer with J Ramon regarding Moss
				EEOC charge; prepare letter to EEOC; confer with E
				Cunningham regarding Moss EEOC charge; review
				and restructure search of data; confer with E Espinosa
	0,			regarding manual review; review correspondence from
				Gray and Bettersworth to investors; consider need for
				additional LEC; research regarding LEC providers;
	, 0			teleconference with K Kennedy regarding C Bebel; e-
				mail correspondence with G Weisbart regarding
	70			questions on report; e-mail correspondence to C Bebel
				regarding Moss claim and HCF; research and
	J			preparation of claims against licensees
8/6/10	Brown, A. G.	4.20	760.20	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
				investors; conduct research regarding investments in
				order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor

requests for information

Date

8/6/10

8/6/10

8/6/10

8/6/10

8/6/10

8/9/10

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al.

Hours

Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Cunningham, E.

Espinosa, E. S.

Frazier, K.

Meisel, S.

Napoli, M. D.

Cunningham, E.

Espinosa, E. S.

Attorney

tireme: 001	nt Value LLC, et	. ai.	Page 5 September 16, 2010 Invoice: 2255980
<u>Iours</u>	Amount	<u>Description</u>	
0.70	171.05	Telephone call to EBOC in Michael Napoli regarding TEBOC investigator; confer regarding mediation and res	Fracy Most clarge and with Michael Napoli
4.70	1,504.00	Correspond with FCB regared SunLife; telephone confere M. Napoli in preparation of Napoli and A. Brown regared account invoice and circula conference with E. Lavis (rd. g nCF's wire to nce with K. Kennedy and or KPK&F consult with M. ding ; review te for approval; telephone Am. General); correspond same; draft letter to J. Byers
0.20	No Charge	Correspondence with M. G	oodfried regarding
		document review.	t' PROG 1 !
0.20	No Charge	Er wils to Michael Napoli r	
		s me.	Detters worth regarding
7.50	3,393.75	repare correspondence to confer with E Cunningham	
	Co	charge; teleconference with regarding HCF, settlement review Moss employment to correspondence with A Me	n K Kennedy and B Bishop of Gray claims and Moss; records; e-mail
		regarding same; teleconfer	
	7	regarding Rogers fees; revi	
.0	7	motion and order regarding	
		Rogers budget; correspond	regarding Gray budget and
		Bishop regarding HCF pres	mium payments: review
		report regarding Espinosa regarding Kieslin	claim; confer with E
		K Kennedy regarding Kies	
3.10	561.10	Conduct and respond to tel	
		investors; conduct research	
		order to respond to investo	
		individual accounts; draft r requests for information	esponses to investor
0.90	219.92	Revise letter to EEOC inve	estigator: draft e-mail to
015 0		Michael Napoli regarding	
		negotiations for Tracy Mos	ss charge; complete
	0.000.00	mediation agreement and s	
6.50	2,080.00		a S. Barasch, M. Nielsen, K. garding KPK&F's exposure; regarding review revised

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page 6 September 16, 200 Invoice: 2255980

Date	Attorney	Hours	Amount	Description
2000	1100101			website; telephone conference with G vinones
				regarding same; correspond with C. To ar at FCB and
				B. Bishop regarding HCF's wires, review to update
				Power Point presentation; review 3-uata proposal
				search terms and Issue List; r. view email from W. Rogers; correspond with L. Metrick regarding policy
				administration; consult w th M. Napoli regarding R.
				Ward's correspondence
8/9/10	Frazier, K.	2.70	794.15	Conference with M, Tap oli regarding issues
0,5,10	2 2 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4			list/document rev. w, telephone conference with M.
				Goodfried reg rdir g same; amend issues list.
8/9/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.50	3,393.75	Prepare for ano thend teleconference with S Barasch,
	_			M Nielsen, Kennedy and E Espinosa; confer with E
				Cunningh un regarding T Moss and response to
				EBOC re-earch regarding debt as securities; confer
				with 3 I spinosa regarding same; revise issue
				"b' n' ess" for ESI search; confer with K Frazier
8/9/10	Williams D	1.10	204.08	1 % ding same; 1 eview Receiver's report and communications to
0/9/10	Wilkerson, P.	1.10	204.08	investors on the website to prepare for assisting with
				answering telephone calls from investors in the
			-0°	Receivership office
8/10/10	Brown, A. G.	4.00	724 00	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
	•			investors; conduct research regarding investments in
			62	order to respond to investor questions regarding their
				individual accounts; draft responses to investor
				requests for information; draft e-mail reminder
		.0		regarding web cast; review and revise e-mail
0/10/10	Eminasa E C	7,90	2,528.00	distribution list
8/10/10	Espinosa, E. S.	7.90	2,328.00	Telephone conference with J. Rotunda, P. Goldate, K. Kennedy and M. Napoli regarding
				; correspond
				with ASG regarding JSS policies, PNW remittance;
				Monitor MOSS/EEOC correspondence; consult with
	20 .			M. Napoli regarding
	. 0			review Attachment A to Qualified and Unqualified
				Agreements; adjust presentation to address costs on
	10			hand versus premium projections; address Gray's
				proposed "budget," consult with ASG regarding
				AVIVA policy; correspond with B. Rose regarding updated documents
8, 9/17	Frazier, K.	2.90	852.98	Amend issues list and create boolean search terms for
0/1 //10	a auditory above	U. U	002170	each issue for the eDAT group; correspondence with
				M. Napoli and M. Goodfried regarding same; redact
•				Exhibit As to qualified and unqualified investor
				paperwork; correspondence with E. Espinosa
				regarding same

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Pag , September 16, 2010 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u> 8/10/10	Attorney Jo, S. S.	<u>Hours</u> 0.80	<u>Amount</u> 177.38	Description Conference with Mr. Napoli and Mr. Uninosa, both of the Firm, regarding statutory interpretation of the definition of a security under Teas Drue Sky Laws;
8/10/10	Napoli, M. D.	10.00	4,525.00	Teleconference with K Kenn. dy, J Rotunda, A Goldate and E Espinosa regarding status and claims against licensees; confer with S Jo regarding legal research regarding claims against licensees; legal research regarding claims against licensees; legal research regarding claims against licensees; e-mail correspondence with T Gillum regarding Locke Lord retainer; e-mail correspondence with B Bishop and K Kennedy regarding Gray budget; review order modifying RO; confer with E Espinosa regarding Gray budget revise issue list and search terms for ESI; prepara presentation for investor webcast
8/10/10	Wilkerson, P.	1.00	185.53	Fiel' nevestor telephone calls to the receivership office as required.
8/11/10	Brown, A. G.	3.50	633.50	Conjuct and respond to telephone inquiries from a trestors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
8/11/10	Cunningham, E.	0.20	No Charge	Telephone call to Ari Karpf (Tracy Moss' attorney); telephone conference with EBOC mediator.
8/11/10	Dietel, K.	0.50	174.22	Confer with M. Napoli regarding potential causes of action against licensees for recoupment of commissions
8/11/10	Dotson, J. R.	173	338.47	Receipt and consideration of Retirement Value mail at its offices and P.O. Box; minor maintenance at Retirement Value offices; updating policy premium status chart; e-mail to E Espinosa regarding all of the above
8/11/10	Espinosa, F. Z	8.30	2,656.00	Correspond with Chase Bank regarding release of \$100,000 to Roger's counsel; Consult with G. Quinones regarding website updates; Correspond with ASG regarding investor inquiry; Correspond with M. Aizen regarding webinar; Coordinate Gray's "budget" draw with B. Bishop and M. Napoli; Telephone conference with R. Tafoya regarding ISC and LEs; telephone conference with B. Davis regarding AGL130; Correspond with ASG regarding projections; and prepare for and deliver the investor presentation.
5/. 1/10	Frazier, K.	0.50	147.07	Telephone conference with S. Jo regarding securities law research and underlying facts of the RV investments

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Pag., 8 September 16, 20 0 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u> 8/11/10	Attorney Jo, S. S.	3.30	<u>Amount</u> 731.71	Description Conduct legal research into statutory in pretation of the definition of a security under Texas Educ Sky laws;
				telephone conference with Ms. Fr. vier, of the Firm, regarding the structure of the in elest in life insurance
8/11/10	Napoli, M. D.	10.30	4,660.75	policies Teleconference with R Tofoya of ISC; prepare
				investor presentation; research claims against licensees; confer with K D letel regarding demand letter for e-radio correspondence with B Bishop regarding Gray builder, attend investor presentation
8/12/10	Brown, A. G.	2.20	398.20	Conduct and r spc to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in
				order to respond to investor questions regarding their
				individua accounts; draft responses to investor reques's r information
8/12/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.20	No Charge	E-m. ils offrom M Napoli regarding efforts to
				in'er iew ; left message for Mr. at number we have
8/12/10	Espinosa, E. S.	3.40	1,088.00	h eview Webinar presentation, revise and post to the
				website; Consult with A. Merrick regarding COO/COB forms and "Projections 2" spreadsheet;
			-O'	Review and respond to correspondence from multiple
				investors; Review webcast participant data;
				Correspondence with G. Quinones regarding updates
			5	to website; consult with M. Napoli and J. Fine
0/10/10	T2! T	1.00	175 10	regarding Hill Country Funding.
8/12/10	Fine, J.	1.00	475.13	Extended work session with M Napoli and EE
		40	7	regarding bankruptcy issues concerning liquidation of illiquid policies;
8/12/10	Frazier, K.	0.10	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Napoli and M. Goodfried regarding results of eDAT searches.
8/12/10	Jo, S. S.	3.20	709.54	Conduct legal research under Florida, North Dakota,
	0,			Ohio and Texas law regarding statutory interpretation
				of the definition of a security
8/12/10	Napoli M. D.	6.80	3,077.00	Review questions from attendees; research issues
				raised by investors; prepare new FAQ's in response; confer with E Espinosa regarding;
				review hits based on revised issue searches; revise
•	70.			issue searches; e-mail correspondence with M
+.C				Goodfried regarding same; confer with E Espinosa
				regarding response to questions; Confer with J.
				Fine and E. Espinosa regarding Hill Country Funding
1/1 1/10	Stephens, B.L.	0.30	No Charge	Organize ESI in preparation for loading into Ringtail
8/13/10	Brown, A. G.	1.90	343,90	per request of M Goodfried. Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
UI IUI IU	201111, 12. U.	1.70	5,50	investors; conduct research regarding investments in
				order to respond to investor questions regarding their

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

	Pag 9
September	16, 200
Invoice:	2255980

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	Description individual accounts; draft responses to restor
				requests for information
8/13/10	Dietel, K.	0.30	No Charge	Review e-mail correspondence non S. Jo regarding
				definition of security and case virority regarding
				same
8/13/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.30	2,016.00	Correspond with M. Napoli regarding Carbonite;
				consult with G. Quinores regarding updates to
				website; review A/P from 3KD; transfer funds to
				operating account; correspond with TSSB regarding
				correspond with C.
				Bobick at JSS; Liephone conference with P. Dennis at
				BKD regarding A/P; restated financial statements;
				deposit e crow refund at Wells Fargo; telephone
				conference with S. Adams and M. Mullins at Wells
				Far : Lansfer premium amounts from subaccounts to
				m or account; telephone conference with W. Dickens
8/13/10	Jo, S. S.	2.60	576.50	Conduct legal research regarding the definition of a
				s curity under Florida, Ohio, North Dakota and Texas
0/10/10	37 11 3 E TS	# CO	0.000 ##	aw; draft email summary of research results
8/13/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.50	3,393.75	Correspondence with J Hatchett regarding Carbonite
				subscription; confer with R Sanchez regarding Ringtail and issues list for review of electronic documents;
				prepare additional FAQ's for investors based on
			Co	webcast questions; prepare additional materials for
		•		investors; revise proposed order regarding Gray living
				expenses; correspondence with K Kennedy regarding
				Rogers; review analysis ; confer
		4.0		with K Dietel regarding additional research; review
				and analysis of documents ; confer
				with K Dietel and E Espinosa regarding claims against
-14-43-				
8/13/10	Sanchez, J. K.	1.30	176.48	Prepare and load ESI documents to Ringtail.
8/15/10	Napoli, M. U.	3.50	1,583.75	Analysis of communications between RV and
0/16/10	Dioto V	2 00	075 60	begin memo for TSSB regarding same
8/16/10	Dietei, K.	2.80	975.60	Review and analyze case authority
8/16/10	Lep nosa, E. S.	5.20	1,664.00	Telephone conference with P. Barcham regarding
			2,000.000	

Telephone conference with P. Barcham regarding request for hard-copy report and exhibits; telephone conference with D. Lieber of the Ft. Worth Star Telegram; review files regarding Mielke and Ackels; consult with A. Brown regarding J. Roger (HCF); IRA accounts; consult with A. Merrick regarding COO and COB forms and MET 650; consult with M. Napoli and K. Kennedy regarding Roger's budget; arrange wire to ASG; correspond with G. Quinones regarding update to website; correspond with J. Gill regarding R.

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Date	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	<u>Description</u> Redenbaugh's inquiry
8/16/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.20	3,710.50	Teleconference with K Kennedy, E I'spinosa regarding Rogers budget; review Rogers budget information; email correspondence with J Gil'an regarding budget and retainer; prepare memo to a Goldate regarding correspondence with a Brown regarding IRA accounts; review application for fees by Bishop; research regarding lice is a spiper FAQs for investors; teleconferance with K Kennedy regarding webcast; Rogers and accounts regarding Midwest and due diligence review. Tresearch regarding
8/16/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1.80	244.35	Load "Inve. or name" coding to Ringtail case; Load additiona Ef'I documents to Ringtail
8/17/10	Brown, A. G.	1.90	343.90	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from invertor; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their indual accounts; draft responses to investor quests for information
8/17/10	Dietel, K.	5.50	1,916.37	Review and analyze case authority
8/17/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.20	1 984 00	Telephone conference with K. Kennedy and A. Goldwater regarding Roger's Budget; telephone conference with (investor) regarding distribution; telephone conference with Chase Court Levy Department regarding transfer to Rogers of \$100k; review Roger's budget on a line item basis and consult with M. Napoli regarding reasonable amount; correspondence with regarding IRA distributions; correspond with ASG regarding AXA policies xxx4091 and xxx9335/ correspond with J. Hatchet regarding Carbonite subscription; correspond with L. Tauchert regarding Investor Questionnaire; review FINRA Notice to Members; telephone conference with C. Valdez at Wells Fargo regarding establishing CEO access; review FINRA licensure of licensees
8/17/10	Trazier, K.	0.50	147.07	Correspondence with M. Napoli regarding document review, correspondence with B.A. Maxwell and S. Jo
8/7/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.80	3,982.00	regarding same Teleconferences with E Espinosa, K Kennedy and A Goldate regarding Rogers budget; e-mail correspondence with A Goldate regarding analyze Rogers budget and backup information; confer with E Espinosa regarding Rogers budget; prepare e- mail to K Kennedy and A Goldate regarding

Page: 10 September 16, 200 Invoice: 2255980

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 11 September 16, 27.0 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	<u>Description</u> Receiver's position on Rogers budget: rearch and
8/17/10	Stephens, B.L.	1.00	171.95	review evidence of scienter by Roge. 8 and Gray; analysis of data regarding Series 7 nonsees; develop recovery strategy for FINRA registered licensees Perform strategic database quartes in Ringtail and compile and allocate results to review by attorney
8/18/10	Dietel, K.	4.30	No Charge	review team per requert of M Goodfried. Review and analyze or secuthority regarding investment contract a a security and application to life settlement contracts.
8/18/10	Dotson, J. R.	1.20	369.24	E-mails to/fro a M Napoli regarding potential interview of); lengthy conference calls with regarding potential interview; e-mails to from M Napoli regarding same; e-mail to Mr. 1 garding same
8/18/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5,20	1,664.00	Review Chase Financial alerts for A/P; review, crecute and transmit Wells Fargo CEO agreement; correspond with ASG regarding COO/COB forms; correspond with R. James; consult with A. Brown regarding invoices from New Perspectives; consult
			5	with M. Napoli regarding Jack Leslie; review ASB table of ownership to beneficiary status; review BKD WIP detail; correspond with M. Lawrence regarding Tompson's investment; Coordinate consolidation of licensee payment information; consult with P. Dennis; transmit P/R data for filing of quarterly reports; review
	*	10		and execute authorization form COO/COB forms for Pacific Life; consult with M. Napoli regarding Hill Country Funding - Wells Fargo Lease; correspond with R. Petry at Frost regarding documents request
8/18/10	Frazier, K.	0.70	205.89	Conference with B.A. Maxwell and S. Jo regarding document review, correspondence with M. Napoli regarding same
8/18/10	Jo, S. S.	3.10	687.36	Conference with Ms. Frazier, of the Firm, regarding document review; review receiver report; conduct document review
8/18/10	N4, oli, M. D.	6.00	2,715.00	Analysis of claims against preparation for interview of J.; correspondence with J Dotson regarding and interviews; research counsel for RV; confer with K. Frazier regarding ESI review; e-mail correspondence regarding Gray monthly stipend; e-mail correspondence with A Goldate regarding
8/19/10	Brown, A. G.	1.30	235.30	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 12 September 16, 200 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
				individual accounts; draft responses to prestor
		4.70	F.F. 40	requests for information
8/19/10	Dietel, K.	1.60	557.49	Review and analyze case authority regarding
				investment contract as a securit / and application to life settlement contracts
0/10/10	Datas I D	0.20	No Charge	E-mails from M Napoli regarding scheduled interview
8/19/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.20	No Charge	of ; e-mails fr m Seth Meisel and M Napoli
				regarding retirement v luc mail
8/19/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.40	1,728.00	Telephone conferent with Chase regarding \$100,000
0/15/10	даритова, д. с.	5110	1,720.00	transfer to Rogers in unfulfilled document requests;
				review; consult with P.
				Dennis regarding status of Quarterly Reports; review
				Salesforce Latrics report; consult with K. Frazier
				regarding do ament review; review correspondence
				from S Naisel regarding RV mail; review S. Baker's
				Tex. Bur profile; telephone conference with
				Commute and R. Harloff regarding terminating back-
				u, subscription auto-renewal
8/19/10	Frazier, K.	2.10	617.67	conference call with J. A. Halter, M. Napoli and S. Jo;
04040		0.00	061.56	Collow up conference with S. Jo.
8/19/10	Meisel, S.	2.80	861.56	Confirm integrity of facility and retrieve
				correspondence; deliver files to Wendy Rogers' office; analyze correspondence received by RV and update
				spreadsheets regarding premium payment deadlines
				and related accounts receivable obligations; draft email
		*		to Eduardo Espinosa regarding same.
8/19/10	Napoli, M. D.	6.80	3,077.00	Research regarding correspondence with
0/12/120	1 tapon, 112. 21	0.00	3,077.00	K Kennedy regarding interview; research
		4.0		regarding Scott Baker, Roy Mouer and other counsel;
				confer with S Jo and K Frazier regarding ESI search;
				correspondence with J Halter regarding ESI; work on
				fee application; confer with E Espinosa regarding
	0,)		Baker, Mouer and Leslie; analysis of scienter issues
				regarding Rogers and Gray; consider joinder of
				as defendant
8/20/10	Brown, A. G.	3.10	561.10	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
				investors; conduct research regarding investments in
•	20			order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor
				requests for information
8/5/1/11	Dietel, K.	2.80	975.60	Review and analyze e-mail correspondence and other
0 2 10	Diotor, IV.	2,00	5.0.00	documents regarding Retirement Value
8/2 0/10	Espinosa, E. S.	9.10	2,912.00	Consult with M. Napoli regarding legal files from R.
,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	-T		•	Mouer and S. Baker; telephone conference with
				(investor); draft initial application for payment
				of administrative expenses; consult with A. Brown and
				M. Napoli regarding investor request for

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al.

Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	Description commissionaires; research payments tr Mouer; research payment to S. Baker and Tri usatra Management; consult with A. Bre vn, review and redact invoices
8/20/10	Napoli, M. D.	5.80	2,624.50	Teleconference with R Mouer, teleconference with J Halter and S Jo regarding ES1, prepare e-mail to R Mouer; teleconference with State Bar regarding S Baker; prepare correspondence to S Baker regarding records; confer with L hapinosa regarding fee application; e-mail consepondence with J Halter regarding logities of review; research regarding J Leslie; review notes of comments at monthly licensee medings; analysis of claims against S Baker; consider sees to obtain documents from Baker; confer with E Bayinosa regarding stratery, analysis of claims against broker/dealer licenses
8/21/10	Napoli, M. D.	6.00	2,715.00	R vise background memo for document review; p epare fee application; review and revise application for non-KLG professionals
8/22/10	Napoli, M. D.	3.50	1,583.75	Prepare fee application; legal research regarding same; prepare memo to E Espinosa regarding same
8/23/10	Brown, A. G.	1.60	289 50	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
8/23/10	Cunningham, E.	C.74	No Charge	Telephone call to Tracy Moss' counsel regarding EBOC charge; review of wage verifications.
8/23/10	Dietel, K.	2.50	No Charge	Review and analyze case authority regarding treatment of life settlement investment as security; confer with M. Napoli and E. Espinosa regarding document review
8/23/10	Espinosa, 7.5	6.80	2,176.00	Telephone conference with D. McCully and T. Lovelace at BKD regarding calculating 2009 tax filings; draft insert for Application addressing obstacles faced by the Receivership; correspond with P. Dennis regarding Quarterly P/R taxes; tabulate K&L invoices, discounts and write offs for Fee Application; consult with A. Brown regarding Investor Relation Status; correspond with D. Lieber at FW Star Telegram; review Gray's 8/20 HCF missive
8/27/10	Frazier, K.	0.30	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Napoli, S. Jo and J.A. Halter regarding document review.
3/23/10	Napoli, M. D.	10.00	4,525.00	Prepare fee application; teleconference with K Kennedy regarding and Rogers budget; e-mail correspondence with J Gillum regarding Rogers budget; review revisions to proposed order; confer

Page: 13 September 16, 201 J Invoice: 2255980

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al.

Client/Matter #; 1203981.00001

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	<u>Description</u>
8/23/10	Sanchez, J. R.	2.40	325.80	with K Dietel regarding document review Load ESI in Ringtail in preparation in the Lorney review; setup ISSUE tags in Ring and
8/23/10	Stephens, B.L.	0.30	No Charge	Conduct analysis and collabora' (c) with team to organize, stage and load ESI (c) Angtail in preparation
8/24/10	Brown, A. G.	3.40	615.40	for attorney review. Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to it estor questions regarding their individual account. Laft responses to investor requests for in our mon
8/24/10	Cunningham, E.	0.30	73.31	Review employ— nandbook regarding vacation pay issue; confe. with Michael Napoli regarding vacation pay issue and Tracy Moss.
8/24/10	Espinosa, E. S.	7.60	2,432.00	Review a. d revise Fee Application; draft Receiver's declarion; update Motion to Approve Professional's fersional with R. Petry at Frost regarding a sbursement to R. Gray; consult with M. Napoli egarding R. Mower's files; executed Order regarding Gray/Roger living expenses; redact K&L bills for fee Application; review draft letter to S. Baker; provide K.
8/24/10	Frazier, K.	1.80	527.43	Kennedy with draft Application Telephone conference with M. Napoli, S. Jo, M. Goodfried, J.A. Halter and EDAT attorneys in Seattle regarding document review; follow up correspondence with M. Goodfried and M. Napoli regarding same; conference with R. Sanchez regarding inclusion of additional documents in Ringtail.
8/24/10	Napoli, M. D.	9.80	4,434.50	Prepare fee application and related documents; training session for reviewers for ESI; review order regarding Rogers budget; e-mail correspondence with J Gillum regarding same; prepare letter to S Baker; ; prepare for interview
8/25/10	Brow G.	0.80	144.80	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
8/2-/10	Cunningham, E.	0.30	73.31	Return telephone call to EEOC mediator; telephone conference with Tracy Moss' counsel regarding EEOC charge.
%/25/10	Dietel, K.	2.00	No Charge	Review and analyze case authority regarding
8/25/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.90	276.93	investment contract as a security Conference with E Espinosa and M Napoli regarding interview of the conference; meeting with

Page: 14 September 16, 27 0 Invoice: 2255980

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al.

Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	Description
8/25/10	Espinosa, E. S.	8.00	2,560.00	prior to interview Consult with M. Napoli and J. Dotso. regarding meeting with Consult with K. Kennedy, A. Goldate and M. Napoli regarding status of the case; Meet with K. Kennedy, A. Goldate and M. Napoli; post-meeting de-briefing with K. Kennedy, A Goldate and M. Napoli
8/25/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.00	3,620.00	Interview; Met with A Goldate and K. Kennedy
8/26/10	Brown, A. G.	2.00	362.00	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct esearch regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
8/26/10	Dietel, K.	3.00	1,045.29	Review SPC staff report regarding Life Settlements; begind of the following seturn of license commissions
8/26/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.70	1,824.00	Sumarizing RV burn-rate January 2010 - April 2010; correspond with A. Merrick regarding premium optimization; review correspondence and due diligence checklist; correspond with R. Tafoya at ISC; consult with P. Dennis regarding New Braunfels Utilities; solicit reconnaissance on S. Baker; consult with M. Napoli regarding "Casewatch" article on G. Kindness and R. Gray's knowledge of the scope of his felony conviction; correspond with A. Merrik at ASG regarding COO/COB status; premium optimization, scrub report, update health data
8/26/10	Napoli, M. D.	VO, P	3,620.00	Teleconference with R Janvey regarding prepare memo regarding same; review order regarding Rogers budget; teleconference with K Kennedy regarding Bishop fees and correspondence with J Gillum regarding Rogers budget; e-mail correspondence with J Gillum and B Bishop regarding wiring instructions; negotiate with R Tafoya of ISC regarding cost LE projections; e-mail correspondence to K Kennedy regarding fee application; prepare correspondence to A Goldate and K Kennedy regarding documents; confer with E Espinosa regarding motion to consolidate and sale of building; e-mail correspondence with B Bishop regarding ATT bills; e-mail correspondence with A Merrick regarding status of health updates and premium optimization; begin research on motion to consolidate
8/27/10	Brown, A. G.	1.60	289.60	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in

Page: 15 September 16, 2013 Invoice: 2255980

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al.

Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	Description order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor
		4.50		requests for information
8/27/10	Dotson, J. R.	1.90	584.63	Receipt and consideration of Revenent Value mail at
				its offices and P.O. box; updating policy premium
				status chart; e-mail to E Espinosa regarding all of the above
8/27/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.80	2,176.00	Telephone conference viv.
3/2//10	Espinosa, E. D.	0.00	2,170.00	CEO account at We'ls Fargo online; coordinate fund
				transfer with Fros, Coneration CU and Chase
				regarding Gray/Rovers budget; consult with P. Dennis
				and J. Wetz rega. Jing NBU bills; consult with M.
				Napoli and Halter regarding records archival
				services: (or espond with Frost regarding closing
				account it xx9887; review RV mail and update A.
				Mer. k, review premium budget/balance due and
				Sear one projections; telephone conference with J. Kroney and B. Murphy at Fox Financial; review
				F NRA Notice to members 06-38, 9-42, 10-22; update
				. Dennis regarding transfer amounts.
8/27/10	Frazier, K.	0.20	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Napoli, M. Goodfried and
	,		40	J.A. Halter regarding W. Rodgers documents.
8/27/10	Napoli, M. D.	6.50	2, 741.35	Review/revise ISC contract; confer with E Espinosa
				regarding building; research regarding motion to
		(5	consolidate; e-mail correspondence with R Tafoya of
				ISC; correspondence with counsel regarding wiring
				instructions and certifications for September stipend; teleconference with J Rooney of Fox Financial;
		. 4'0'		research Fox Financial;
8/30/10	Brown, A. G.	1.70	307.70	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
				investors; conduct research regarding investments in
				order to respond to investor questions regarding their
	O ,)		individual accounts; draft responses to investor
	0			requests for information
8/30/10	Espinera, L. S.	4.80	1,536.00	Draft insert to Application and affidavit regarding
				RV's burn rate; telephone conference with A. Merrick regarding investor calls; correspond with R. Quadros;
				Correspond with B. Rose regarding Chang e of
•	10			ownership/beneficiary status; Consult with A. Goldate
•.0				regarding Fox financial interest's in RV's portfolio;
				correspond with R. James regarding the Pethes policy;
				Review the ISC Agreement.
(/3)/10	Frazier, K.	0.40	117.65	Telephone conference with M. Napoli, M. Goodfried
				and J.A. Halter regarding W. Rogers data;
8/30/10	Napoli, M. D.	9.00	4,072.50	correspondence regarding same. Research regarding motion to consolidate; e-mail
VI 10C10	тароп, ил. гл.	5.00	7,072.30	correspondence and teleconference with K Kennedy

Page: 15 September 16, 200 Invoice: 2255980

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page 17 September 16, 20 Invoice: 2255980

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	Description regarding teleconference with J Hall at and M Goodfried regarding production of documents and review of Rogers data; e-mail opposphence with R Tafoya of ISC regarding pricing, review Fox Financial consent order; teleconference with J Gillum regarding Rogers budget and stignal tion; confer with E Espinosa regarding claims against mensees and ISC contract;
8/31/10	Brown, A. G.	2.10	380.10	review corresponder. It in investors Conduct and responder to telephone inquiries from investors; con fact research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual at rounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; review and revise documents
8/31/10	Dietel, K.	5.50	1,916.37	in prer at tion for filing with court Cot for with M. Napoli regarding state securities laws reserved project; conduct research and analyze state socurities laws where active licensees were located
8/31/10	Espinosa, E. S.	7.20	2,304.00	elephone conference with J. Rotunda, K. Kennedy, A. Goldate and M. Napoli ; Consult with Wells Fargo regarding CBO banking; Consult with J. Winebrenner @ Chase regarding Roger's draw; Coordinate document execution with B. Rose at ASG; Finalize ISC engagement; Review Active licensees, state of residence and disbursement amount— reconcile same with QB.
8/31/10	Frazier, K.	0.70 1	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Napoli regarding document review.
8/31/10	Napoli, M. D.	9.50	4,298.75	Teleconference with J Rotunda, A Goldate, E Espinosa and K Kennedy; confer with E Espinosa regarding settlement strategy, confer with K Dietel regarding research prepare fee applications; prepare motion to consolidate; prepare correspondence to counsel regarding discovery; teleconference with K Kennedy; confer with E Espinosa regarding payments to licensees
	J	mo.		4.50 0.0

TOTAL HOURS

467.80

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$160,491.94

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

September 16, 20 0 Invoice: 2255980

TIMEKEEPER SU	MMÁRY			VO		
<u>Timekeeper</u>		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>		
Fine, J.	(Discounted 9.5%)	1.00	475.13	475.13		
Napoli, M. D.	(Discounted 9.5%)	188.60	452.50	85,341.50		
Dietel, K.	(Discounted 9.5%)	21.70	24 2 43	7,560.94		
Espinosa, E. S.	(Discounted Flat-Rate)	140,30	320.00	44,896.00		
Dotson, J. R.	(Discounted 9.5%)	8.60	307.70	2,646.22		
Meisel, S.	(Discounted 9.5%)	2.80	307.70	861.56		
Frazier, K.	(Discounted 9.5%)	11.60	294.13	3,411.91		
Cunningham, E.	(Discounted 9.5%)	4.20	244.35	1,026.30		
Jo, S. S.	(Discounted 9.5%)	13.00	221.73	2,882.49		
Wilkerson, P.	(Discounted 9.5%)	2.10	185.53	389.61		
Brown, A. G.	(Discounted 9.5%)	55.70	181.00	10,081.70		
Stephens, B.L.	(Discounted 9.5%)	1.20	171.95	171.95		
Sanchez, J. R.	(Discounted 9.5%)	5-7	135.75	746.63		
Total for All Timeke	eepers	4 57.80	\$343.08	\$160,491.94		

INVOICE TOTAL

	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>	<u>Total</u>
Prior Outstanding Balance Pue	641,304.00	0.00	641,304.00
Current Charges	160,491.94	0.00	160,491.94
N(t = 1)lance	801,795.94	0.00	801,795.94
TOTAL	BALANCE DUE TE	IIS MATTER	\$801,795,94

PAYMENT DUE IN FULL ON OR BEFORE OCTOBER 16, 2010

Judicial contrains of the state of the state

K&L Gates ILP 1717 Main Street Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

T 214,939,5500

www.klgates.com

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DO NOT DISCLOSE

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

Delober 14, 2010 Livoice: 2273826 Matter Desa State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Clienta fatter #: 1203981.00001

This statement covers fees for legal services rendered for your account during the period ending 09/30/2010. Detailed information regarding these fees is attached.

Current Charges:

Fees

135,282.95

Total Current Charges

\$135,282.95

UNPAID INVOICES AS OF 10/14/ 2019

Invoice Date	Invo	Number	Unpaid Amount
06/17/10	.9	2206649	305,328.50
07/19/10	X .	2224392	184,646.50
08/16/10		2240115	151,329.00
09/16/10		2255980	160,491.94

TOTAL UNPAYON YOICE(S):

801,795,94

TOTAL DUE

\$937,078.89

AYMENT FOR "CURRENT AMOUNT" IS DUE IN FULL ON OR BEFORE NOVEMBER 13, 2010

Please Return a Copy of This Page With Your Payment to the Pittsburgh Office at 210 Sixth Avenue, Pittsburgh, PA 15222-2613 Attn: Accounts Receivable Department or Reference Invoice: 2273826

Payment Can Also be Made by wire to: The Bank of New York Mellon, ABA Routing Number: 043000261, Account # 127-2657, K&L Gates, AIS Account, Reference Invoice 2273826

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gates up 1717 Main Street Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

т 214.939.5500

www.klgates.com

october 14, 2010

Invoice: 2273826

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DO NOT DISCLOSE

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RECORDED AS OF 09/30/10.

Matter: 1203981.00001

Matter Description: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC et al.

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	Hours	Amount	Pascription
9/1/10	Brown, A. G.	2.40	434.40	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
				investors; conduct research regarding investments
				in order to respond to investor questions regarding
			0	their individual accounts; draft responses to
				investor requests for information; review and revise documents in preparation for filing with court;
			\mathbf{O}	office conference with P. Wilkerson regarding case
				status and follow-up needed
9/1/10	Dietel, K.	6.5.7	2,195.11	Conduct research and analyze state securities laws
2/1/10	210001, 12.		2,120,11	where active licensees located; prepare spreadsheet
				summarizing same
9/1/10	Dotson, J. R.	1.60	492.32	Receipt and consideration of Retirement Value
				mail at RV's office and P.O. Box; updating policy
				premium status chart; e-mail to E Espinosa
		6.00	0.150.00	regarding same
9/1/10	Espinosa L S.	6.80	2,176.00	Review correspondence with S. Racor, R. Quadar;
				review A/P; review premium disbursement and transfer funds accordingly; telephone conference
	G			with J. Winebrenner at Chase regarding Roger's
				draft; correspondence with R. Tafoya at ISC;
. (correspond with C. Valdez at Wells Fargo
	O			regarding CEO; review correspondence regarding
				policies and transmit to ASG; review R.
				Thornburg's postcard; review certificates for
				September draw; correspond with R. Petry at Frost
04140	30 11 34 73	6.50	2.041.25	regarding D. Gray production
9/1/10	Napoli, M. D.	6.50	2,941.25	Prepare motion to consolidate; review certifications for W Rogers and R Gray; review motion to
				withdraw by Locke Lord; prepare response to
				demand letter by S Rosen.

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page ?. October 14, 2 ? 0 Invoice: 2273820

75. /		T	A	Decembring
Date 0/1/10		<u>1ours</u> 0.60	<u>Amount</u> 81.45	<u>Description</u> Load documents (hard copies colle 1. 14 from RV)
9/1/10	Sanchez, J. R.	0.00	01.45	to Ringtail.
0/1/10	Williamon D	1,20	222,64	Conference and email with Abiyan Brown
9/1/10	Wilkerson, P.	1,20	222,04	regarding recent status of the receivership; review
				website and other informal on for purposes of
010110	27.1 . 1 T7	0.00	075.60	telephone calls from investors.
9/2/10	Dietel, K.	2.80	975.60	Conduct research and nalyze state securities laws
				where active license is Deated; provide status
		- 10	1 (20 00	update to M. Nar in garding research
9/2/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.10	1,632.00	Telephone confidence with to schedule a
				conference review policy correspondence and
				forward to A.J.; telephone conference with S.
				Barasch . garding policies and scheduling; review
				Mover do uments; consult with P. Wilkerson
				regarding webmail; review letter; review
				c. is lidated financial's from BKD; telephone
				conserence with
9/2/10	Frazier, K.	0.20	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Napoli and S. Jo
				regarding additional licensee training to be
				reviewed.
9/2/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.50	3,846.25	Prepare motion to consolidate; prepare response to
				2d letter from Rosen; confer with E Espinosa
				regarding settlement strategy/conferences with
				and confer with K Dietel
				regarding Blue Sky research; analysis of Mouer
			154.10	documents
9/2/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1	176.48	Prepare Roy Mouer production documents for
		0_		loading into Ringtail.
9/2/10	Wilkerson, P.	1.50	278.30	Respond to telephone calls from investors; read
		•		emails received from investors and respond as
				required; review online documentation for
				receivership
9/3/10	Espinose E. S.	6.20	1,984.00	Review COO/COD update; correspond with B.
				Rose regarding same; coordinate release of
				Approved living Expense for Gray and Rogers
	, O			from GCU and Chase, respectively; correspond
				with P. Dennis at BKP regarding fund transfer;
	70			remit PacLife expenses
9/3/10	Frazier, K.	0.10	No Charge	Correspondence with M. Goodfried regarding
				document review.
5.3/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.50	3,393.75	Legal research regarding sale of property by
				receiver; prepare motion to consolidate; prepare
				negotiation points for and and; confer
				with E Espinosa regarding status of negotiations
9/3/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1.20	162.90	Prepare and load Roy Mouer production documents
				into Ringtail.
9/5/10	Espinosa, E. S.	1.00	320.00	Review and revise Motion to Consolidate

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

	Page: 3
October	14, 2010
Invoice:	2273826

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	Amount	<u>Description</u>
9/5/10	Jo, S. S.	0.40	88.69	Review contents of compact disc taken com hard drive image of Wendy Rogers compact.
9/7/10	Espinosa, E. S.	7.20	2,304.00	Telephone conference with (investor); consult with A. Merrick regal in 200/COBs;
				premium forecasts, death tra. ''g, etc.; correspond
				with S. Adams and W. Giles at Wells Fargo
				regarding direct pay; con spond with B. Rose
				regarding open COO/C OB items and LBL; review
				policy; revie v f SG July invoice; consult M.
				Napoli regarding conversation with ; review
				Broker-Deale, rest urces; review
				correspondence; analyze Capital raised in abandoned coincided policies; analyze premium
				reserves are front shortfalls
9/7/10	Frazier, K.	0.40	117.65	Corre po. dence with M. Napoli and S. Jo
	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,			reg dang Wendy Rogers licensee teleconference.
9/7/10	Jo, S. S.	6.80	1,507.76	Cor fuct due diligence on copy of files from
				Vendy Rogers' computer; conduct due diligence
				on Retirement Value conference call dated August 26, 2009
9/7/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.50	3,393.75	Revise motion to consolidate; review
2///10	14apon, 141. 17.	1.50	3,335.73	; teleconference with regarding
				settlement; confer with E Espinosa
				regarding same; work on settlement presentation
		. 6	6	for
9/7/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1.80	244.35	Prepare and load ESI documents to Ringtail
9/7/10	Wilkerson, P.	0.3	No Charge	File management regarding investor questions; review telephone messages from investors
9/8/10	Dietel, K.	J0	348,43	Draft analysis of case authority
5,0,10	210101, 12		_ ,_,,	
9/8/10	Dotson, J. R.	1.60	492.32	Receipt and consideration of mail at Retirement
				Value offices and P.O. Box.
9/8/10	Espinosa, E. J.	7.10	2,272.00	Consult with P. Dennis regarding (1) recordation of
				policies as RV assets (cost and premiums); (2) Capital raised as an RV liability; maintaining
	20 1			Licensee payments segregated; consult with M.
	C			Napoli regarding capitalization of
				abandoned/rescinded policies; quarterly P/R taxes;
	70-			review Harrison petition; correspond with A.
				Merrick and K. Henderson regarding ISC LEs;
				review memo regarding
				policy; consult with A. Merrick regarding Burn Rate; research Wells Fargo balances with Premium
				disbursement; analyze funds on deposit in
				connection with burn rate to estimate each policy's
				expiration; research

Date 9/8/10

9/8/10

9/8/10

9/8/10

9/8/10

9/9/10

9/9/10

9/9/10

9/9/10

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Hours

Amount

Attorney

Description
Correspondence with S. Jo regarding review of
Wendy Roger's audio conference.
Conduct due diligence on Aug 1st 26, 2009
Conference Call taken from v endy Rogers'
computer; revise due diligance memorandum to
incorporate the same
Review and analyze policy;
review correspondence regarding; review
corres a nuence regarding for
settlement negations; prepare memo regarding
malpractic pol'cy; revise motion to consolidate;
confer with Laspinosa regarding policies near
premium, exhaustion; confer with M Nielsen
regard ne new suit against RV et al; review suit; e-
mail orrespondence with K Kennedy regarding
s no review documents for settlement
meting
Lovide ESI material in preparation to loading into
Ringtail per request of M Goodfried.
Telephone conferences with investors; email with
investors; conference with receiver; file
management
Draft analysis of case authority regarding treatment
of life settlement investment as a security; review
and analyze authority regarding same
Updating policy premium status chart; E-mail to E
Espinosa regarding same and Retirement Value
mail picked up yesterday
Team e-mails regarding objection to attorneys' fee
application; team e-mail regarding Retirement
Value mail issues
Consult with M. Napoli regarding Defendants
objections to Fee application, efficiencies and
billing rates; telephone conference with B. Bishop
and M. Napoli regarding said objections, potential
settlement discussions; telephone conference with
K. Kennedy and M. Napoli regarding discussions
with B. Bishop and J. Weisbart; telephone
conference with J. Weisbart regarding Interveners
contened with J. Weisbart regarding filterveners

; Correspond with J. Dotson

regarding RV's mail; Follow up with Chase Bank

October 14, 200

Invoice: 2273826

ALLUINEY	Hours	ZMIOUME	<u>Bescription</u>
Frazier, K.	0.10	No Charge	Correspondence with S. Jo regarding review of
			Wendy Roger's audio conference.
Jo, S. S.	5.4 0	1,197.34	Conduct due diligence on August 26, 2009
			Conference Call taken from vendy Rogers'
			computer; revise due diligance memorandum to
			incorporate the same
Napoli, M. D.	9.00	4,072.50	Review and analyze policy;
• ,			review correspondence regarding; review
			corres and number regarding for
			settlement negatiations; prepare memo regarding
			malpractic pol'cy; revise motion to consolidate;
			confer with L spinosa regarding policies near
			premiun. ** haustion; confer with M Nielsen
			regard no new suit against RV et al; review suit; e-
			ma'l c rrespondence with K Kennedy regarding
			s no review documents for settlement
			reting
Stephens, B.L.	0.20	No Charge	I rovide ESI material in preparation to loading into
,			Ringtail per request of M Goodfried.
Wilkerson, P.	1.50	278.30	Telephone conferences with investors; email with
			investors; conference with receiver; file
			management
Dietel, K.	6.00	2,(90.58	Draft analysis of case authority regarding treatment
,			of life settlement investment as a security; review
			and analyze authority regarding same
Dotson, J. R.	0.30	No Charge	Updating policy premium status chart; E-mail to E
•	3	_	Espinosa regarding same and Retirement Value
	2		mail picked up yesterday
Dotson, J. R.	0.10	No Charge	Team e-mails regarding objection to attorneys' fee
			application; team e-mail regarding Retirement
			Value mail issues
Espinosa, Γ.	7.20	2,304.00	Consult with M. Napoli regarding Defendants'
0,			objections to Fee application, efficiencies and
			billing rates; telephone conference with B. Bishop
			and M. Napoli regarding said objections, potential
. 0			settlement discussions; telephone conference with
			K. Kennedy and M. Napoli regarding discussions
10			with B. Bishop and J. Weisbart; telephone
			conference with J. Weisbart regarding Interveners'
			objections and; Draft Response to
			inquiry; telephone conference with
			regarding
			RV, Dick Gray, A&O and receiverships generally;
			Review A&O indictments;

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Pag 5 October 14, 2 \(^10\) Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
9/9/10	Meisel, S.	0.30	No Charge	regarding W. Rogers' September line allowance. Analyze docket issues; emails to Abhael Napoli
9/9/10	Napoli, M. D.	8.50	3,846.25	Revise motion to consolidat ; releconference with K Kennedy; teleconference with B Bishop; teleconference with G Wessbart; teleconference with K Kennedy; e m il correspondence regarding document production; vork on settlement packet for production; vork on settlement packet for production; revise vand analyze objections to fee application
9/9/10	Sanchez, J. R.	3.40	461.55	Prepare an (lor l ESI data to Ringtail database; apply issue was to documents
9/10/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.20	No Charge	Filling c. forms for change of address/forwarding of Rei renent Value mail (physical address and P.C. xx); e-mail to E Espinosa regarding same
9/10/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.70	1,824.00	Province Intervenor; objections; analyze Roger's Chase accounts and transmit same to K. Kennedy; coordinate change of address from New Braunfels; brief support staff regarding same; review ASG COO/COB update; correspond with B. Rose regarding status of Lincoln Benefit policy and Review of KPKF original documentation; review Motion to Consolidate; review transmittal of same; consult with A. Merrick regarding status updates; respond to (investor); respond to (investor); respond to (investor); telephone conference with (investor)
9/10/10	Meisel, S.	0.60	184.62	Analyze local rules and confer with James Parsons, staff attorney to Judge Triana-Doyal regarding assignment and hearing issues; conference with Michael Napoli regarding same.
9/10/10	Napoli, 11.).	8.50	3,846.25	Review/analyze intervenors objection to Receiver's fee application; review fee application by Clark Thomas; prepare correspondence to G Weisbart regarding Kiesling; revise motion to consolidate; prepare correspondence to counsel regarding motion to consolidate; research regarding abatement/dismissal of Dallas suit against RV; email correspondence with counsel regarding production of documents; research regarding claims
/10/10	Stephens, B.L.	2.80	481.46	Analyze, organize and edit ESI in preparation for loading into Ringtail in preparation of attorney review and production per request of M. Goodfried
9/10/10	Wilkerson, P.	1.20	222.64	Telephone conferences and email with investors and receiver; file management

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Pag 6 October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u> 9/12/10	Attorney Dietel, K.	<u>Hours</u> 7.00	Amount 2,439.01	Description Draft analysis of case authority ; review
9/12/10	Napoli, M. D.	2.30	1,040.75	and analyze authority regard up same Research regarding abaten en of Dallas suit; prepare settlemen negotiation materials
9/13/10	Brown, A. G.	0.90	162.90	Conduct and respord to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct escarch regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
9/13/10	Burress, D.	0.30	No Charge	Run 3 Accuir reports from 2 separate requests
9/13/10	Dietel, K.	1.20	418.12	and forward results to A. Brown. Draft na ysis of case authority ; research case to the rity regarding same
9/13/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.20	1,664.00	with M. Nielsen regarding delivery of original policies; Review Licensee agreement and position in the RV heirarchy;
			6°.	Follow up with Chase regarding Roger's allowance; Correspond with A. Merrick regarding progress on securing updated medicals; Consult with M. Napoli regarding 11 GB of non-searchable PDFs on Ms. Rogers computer; Respond to inquiries from (investors); Correspond with J. Lawrence regarding ADP.
9/13/10	Meisel, S.	J.30	92.31	Emails to all counsel regarding scheduling issues and fee application; conference with Jon Dotson regarding related hearing issues.
9/13/10	Napoli, M. D	5.70	2,579.25	Confer with R Sanchez regarding production of documents; e-mail correspondence with A Goldate regarding; research regarding; prepare correspondence to regarding documents; e-mail correspondence with G Weisbart regarding hearings and correspondence with B Bishop regarding hearings; prepare settlement packet; work on settlement packet for confer with E Espinosa regarding settlement meeting with and settlement strategy for and teleconference with K Kennedy regarding claims against
9/13/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1.20	162.90	Meet with M. Napoli regarding document

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

October 14, 200 Invoice: 2273820

	<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	Description production; call with J. Blair regarding document production specs; Analyze documents in Ringtail in
	9/13/10	Wilkerson, P.	0.20	No Charge	preparation for document production Telephone conference with grail Brown regarding investor inquirie
	9/14/10	Brown, A. G.	1.40	253.40	Conduct and respond to temphone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to a vestor questions regarding their individual expents; draft responses to investor requests information; update investor files
	9/14/10	Dietel, K.	1.00	348.43	Analyze state accurities laws where active licensees located
	9/14/10	Espinosa, E. S.	4.90	1,568.00	Telepl on conference with A. Merrick regarding Linzon Benefit, Old Mutual, etc.; correspond with I'h. nderson regarding ISC LE's; correspond with Wens Fargo regarding RV account; telephone conference with P. Fitzgerald and D. Anderson regarding Collins IRA; correspond with and (investors) regarding "10-day free look"; consult with M. Napoli regarding various matters
	9/15/10	Brown, A. G.	2.90	534.90	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; update investor files
	9/15/10	Dietel, K.	v.50	174.22	Research and review state securities laws regarding rescission remedy for sale of unregistered securities
	9/15/10	Dotson, J. R.	0.30	92.31	E-mails regarding setting hearing on motion to consolidate portfolio; e-mail to/from E Espinosa regarding Retirement Value mail issues; discuss same with D Warren (paralegal)
70	9/15/10	Espino. , E. S.	4.80	1,536.00	Review Burn-Rate model and forward to M. Napoli for further response to B. Bishop's request for "analysis"; telephone conference with J. Lee at Lewis and Ellis regarding commencement of actuarial analysis efforts; Follow up with Chase regarding Rogers' September 2010 approved expenses; Correspond with Wells Fargo regarding Account #XXX8798; Correspond with A. Merrick regarding No Lapse Guarantee on OM Financial policy;

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 8 October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u> 9/15/10	Attorney Napoli, M. D.	<u>Hours</u> 1.00	<u>Amount</u> 452.50	Description Telephone conference with M Nielse. regarding Dallas suit correspondence with B Bishop to Anding Chase and motion to consolidate; regarding; e-mail
9/15/10	Nelson, J. D.	0.30	No Charge	to A Goldate regarding broke. Conference with J. Dotso regarding travel to New Braunfels.
9/16/10	Brown, A. G.	1.50	271.50	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct the reh regarding investments in order to result of investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; update investor files; prepare locuments for filing with court
9/16/10	Cunningham, E.	0.30	73.31	Complete eraployer's response to unemployment
9/16/10	Dietel, K.	2,50	871.08	application. Research regarding ; caner with M. Napoli regarding issue concerning
9/16/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.70	2,144.00	enue for lawsuit against Retirement Value Meet with ; telephone conference with B. Kovick regarding due diligence info RV; consult with M. Napoli regarding hearing requirements; review K. Henderson's 2nd letter to insured; telephone conference with
		O		correspond with R. Petry at Frost Bank; review initial modifications to Licensee Report; correspond with J. Weinbrenner at Chase regarding Rogers Expenses; review e-data invoice; review
9/16/10	Napoli, M. D.	3.00	1,357.50	E-mail correspondence with J Parsons regarding settings; confer with E Espinosa regarding meeting; prepare certificate of no objections regarding professionals; prepare for meeting;
9/16/10	Nelson, J. D.	1.80	276.93	Retrieve mail and check RV offices; email with E. Espinosa regarding same; forward mail to E. Espinosa.
9/17/10		1.30	235.30	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; update investor files
<i>9</i> /17/10	Dietel, K.	4,70	1,637.62	Research, review and analyze authority regarding venue issue for suit against company in receivership

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Pag 5 October 14, 27.0 Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u> 9/17/10	Attorney Espinosa, E. S.	<u>Hours</u> 5.70	<u>Amount</u> 1,824.00	Description Correspond with J. Winebrenner at Chase regarding Roger's expense; teleph in conference with P. Hasler at Wells Fargo agaiding depositing of Roger's check; update B. Schop regarding expense; update M. Napol. regarding conversation with B. Howard; elicit recommendations regarding Real Estate agents; as iew grown; consult with Na. Napoli regarding reply to (investigation).
9/17/10	Napoli, M. D.	2.60	1,176.50	Confer wit' E I spinosa regarding damage analysis; e-n correspondence regarding Harrison suit; tele_ouference with A Garcia; work on amage analysis
9/17/10	Sanchez, J. R.	4.00	543.00	Prer a. ESI documents for production.
9/17/10	Stephens, B.L.	0.20	No Charge	It'mify and provide source material for review per request of M Goodfried
9/18/10	Espinosa, E. S.	4.80	1,536.00	Correspond with FCB regarding HCF's AXA premium; analyze funds on deposit vis-a-vis Policy Acquisition cost and premium reserves; access Surplus/Deficit per policy and in the aggregate
9/20/10	Brown, A. G.	1.10	19910	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; update investor files
9/20/10	Dietel, K.	∠ 90	696.86	Research, review and analyze authority regarding venue issue for suit against company in receivership; research regarding
9/20/10	Espinosa, E	7.20	2,304.00	Revisit deficit analysis; consult with M. Napoli regarding same; telephone conference with M. Napoli; A. Weisbart and T. Scarborough; draft correspondence to AT&T and Alliant Law Group regarding myriad of AT&T accounts; correspond with W. Giles regarding Real Estate Agent; correspond with B. Rose and C. Bobick regarding LBL policy; coordinate closing HCF's Frost Bank account with R. Petry at Frost and C. Tovar at First Commercial; review research results
. ⁷ 20/10	Napoli, M. D.	1.80	814.50	Review damage model; confer with E Espinosa regarding damage model; teleconference with T Scarborough, G Weisbart and E Espinosa regarding ; review correspondence to ATT; e-mail correspondence with counsel regarding hearing dates

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 10 October 14, 20.0 Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u> 9/20/10	Attorney Sanchez, J. R.	<u>Hours</u> 3.00	<u>Amount</u> 407.25	Description Prepare ESI documents for production Prepare
9/21/10	Brown, A. G.	1.00	181.00	metadata for load files. Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
7/21/10	D10w11, 71. G.	1.00	101.00	investors; conduct research 'e prding investments
				in order to respond to inve. to: questions regarding their individual accounts; aft responses to
				investor requests for i formation; update investor
				files
9/21/10	Cunningham, E.	0.30	73,31	Review claim from Marisa Kane regarding
				vacation pay: with Eddy Espinosa regarding the same.
9/21/10	Dietel, K.	4.50	1,567.94	Research, review and analyze
		6.00	* ***	laws
9/21/10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.90	2,208.00	Revie 1 rensee registrations and TSSB analysis; Final a letters to AT&T & Alliant Law Group;
				Con spond with A. Merrick regarding AGL73L's
				Courage and AGL130 updated medicals;
				Lieet with D. McCully and T. Lovelace regarding
				review of RV's income recognition; telephone
				conference with P. Dennis regarding accounting for fixed assets, premium payments and bank
			-0*	reconciliation's and access to WF accounts;
				Correspond with Chase regarding Rogers' October
				expenses; correspond with IDSTC regarding prior
		4,6	2	request for service termination; Correspond with
				and (investors); T/C w/ (investor).
9/21/10	Frazier, K.	20	No Charge	Telephone conference with B.A. Maxwell
		(0)		regarding document review; follow up
				correspondence with B.A. Maxwell regarding
0/01/10	M	0.70	155 01	same,
9/21/10	Maxwell, P	0.70	155.21	Meeting with M. Napoli regarding privilege review of Retirement Value's hard documents for
				production
9/21/10	Meirel, S.	0.50	153.85	Multiple emails to and from counsel and Michael
			<==0 ===	Napoli regarding scheduling and settlement issues.
9/21/10	Tapoli, M. D.	1.50	678.75	Teleconference with B Bishop; e-mail correspondence regarding hearing dates;
	0			teleconference with K Kennedy; teleconference
				with G Weisbart; review information on registered
				brokers from TSSB; consider presentation on
				damages and claims against confer with
9/21/10	Sanchez, J. R.	1.70	230.78	E Espinosa regarding discussions with Weisbart Prepare production DVDs; Load ESI documents to
7/21/10	Sentonos, o. 10	1110	250,70	Ringtail; Apply ISSUE tags to ESI documents.
9/22/10	Brown, A. G.	0.90	162.90	Conduct and respond to telephone and email
				inquiries from investors; conduct research

	tate of Texas vs. Retirater #: 1203981,0000		Value LLC, et. a	1. Page: 11 October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273826
<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	Description regarding investments in order to research to investor questions regarding their natividual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for
9/22/10	Cunningham, E.	2.30	562.01	information; update investor of services Review Marisa Kane's wage chaim; review files in preparation for response to marisa Kane's wage claim; complete form a guesting information in response to Marisa Mane's wage claim; strategize with Eddy Espines, regarding the same; draft letter to Texas Works response commission regarding Marisa Kane's wage claim.
9/22/10	Dietel, K.	0.50	174.22	Research andview
9/22/10	Espinosa, E. S.	4.60	1,472.00	Teleph in conference with A. Merrick regarding AG'.'. and medicals for AGL130; Analyze cost of CCL vs COI for AGL73L; telephone conference with G. Oliver (licensee); review BKD invoices and conference with P. Dennis regarding KPK & F annual fees; review report from B. Horwick; consult with E. Cunningham regarding M. Kane's
9/22/10	Maxwell, B. A.	0.30	No Charge	claims; correspond with O. Campbell at AGLA Continue to perform privilege review of Retirement
9/22/10	Meisel, S.	0.30	92.31	Value documents for production Multiple emails to Michael Napoli and Barry Bishop regarding fee application and related hearing issues; draft email to the Court; place call to James Parsons.
9/22/10	Napoli, M. D.	2 50	1,131.25	Correspondence with C Orr; research regarding J Ball; research and memo regarding Fox Financial; teleconference with G Weisbart regarding Kiesling, fee application and motion to consolidate; e-mail correspondence with counsel regarding hearings on fee application and motion to consolidate;
9/23/10	Brown A. C.	0.70	126.70	Conduct and respond to telephone and email inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; update investor files
9/23/.0	Espinosa, E. S.	3.60	1,152.00	Telephone conference with conference with regarding his attempts to solicit information directly from insurance carriers and general update, Correspond with TSSB & OAG regarding same; Review Chase checking drafts; telephone conference w. A. Merrick regarding ASG; Correspond with O. Campbell regarding AGLA inquiry; Correspond with B. Bishop regarding

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page 12 October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273826

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	Hours	<u>Amount</u>	Description Rainmaker invoice for Rogers' IRF roduction; Review licensee disbursements for the state of California; Review Interveno.'s email regarding objection to Receiver's App'n ation for fees; Correspond with C. Budner & M. Napoli regarding
9/23/10	Maxwell, B. A.	3.80	842.57	Same. Continue to perform trivilege review of Retirement Value documents for production; draft letter Rule 11 agreement required and confidentiality of produced documents
9/23/10	Meisel, S.	0.30	92.31	Draft emai to Junes Parsons and all counsel regarding hearing issues and prospective motions and hearings.
9/23/10	Napoli, M. D.	0.30	No Charge	Confe with E Espinosa
9/24/10	Brown, A. G.	1.10	199.10	Conduct and respond to telephone and email prouries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
9/24/10	Dietel, K.	1.00	1 48 43	Research regarding c
9/24/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.80	1,456.00	Review correspondence from AT&T review response to S. Rogers; telephone conference with P. Dennis regarding reconciling difference between RV self reported payment to PNW and KPK&F's members; review B. Horwick asset investigation correspondence; correspond with and M. Napoli regarding presponse from S. Schwarz, Receiver's application, and discrepancy between KPK&F and RV's PNW amounts.
9/24/10	Napol., N.i. D.	4.00	1,810.00	Review documents from ; review correspondence from S Rosen regarding ; prepare response to S. Rosen; prepare claims ; review licensee agreements; teleconference with M Quinn regarding ims; confer with E Espinosa regarding strategy for
: /24/10	Sanchez, J. R.	0.70	95.03	Search Ringtail database for slipsheets (place holders for non-printable files) within the ESI documents.
9/25/10	Espinosa, E. S.	7.80	2,496.00	Download updated QB file of Receiver's books; review form licensee agreement and unapproved

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 13 October 14, 200 Invoice: 2273825

<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	bescription state addendum; consult with M. N. oli regarding ; working session regarding licensee data; reconcile KPK&F QB on hey purchase price with RV's 3/25/10 analysis. Receiver's books;
9/25/10	Napoli, M. D.	10.00	4,525.00	review form of demand lead; consult with M. Napoli regarding MTT to consolidate, and issuer rights of action und refer to a and '34 Act Analysis of claim: a anist licensees; research securities. Law; prepare demand letter for licensees, confer with E Espinosa regarding second ment demand research; draft petition against
9/26/10	Espinosa, E. S.	3,20	1,024.00	Pov.ew
9/26/10	Napoli, M. D.	10.20	4,615.50	Prepare petition; research regarding law; prepare letter; research regarding law; review
9/27/10	Boyer, A. L.	0.60	238.92	due diligence materials Confer with M. Napoli about new matter; review materials; confer with associate about additional; review case law on issues.
9/27/10	Brown, A. G.	1,10	199.10	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information; review Motion to Consolidate Portfolio in preparation for filing and electronically file with court
9/27/10	Brunswick, T. G.	2.90	892.33	Conference with A. Boyer regarding investment at issue ; research case and statutory law regarding the same; conference with K. Dietel regarding the same; update letter regarding the same
9/27/10	Pietel, K.	3.70	1,289.19	Review demand letter ; research laws regarding ; confer with L. Brunswick regarding
./2./10	Espinosa, E. S.	6.10	1,952.00	Follow up with P. Dennis regarding entry adjustment based on Saturday's review of QB file; address payment on AXA 346; telephone conference with L. Johnson at AT&T consult with M. Napoli regarding meeting with C. Budner; Model Payment Application discussion; meet with

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 14 October 14, 200 Invoice: 2273826

Date	Attorney	Hours	Amount	Description
				C. Budner and M. Napoli; telephor conference
				with K. Kennedy regarding status report on
				multiple issues; consult with it in poli regarding
				and fee application v lephone conference
				with R. Kirby and M. Nap. li regarding SIPC
0.00	771 1 To 4	0.00	007.70	coverage
9/27/10	Kirby, R.A.	0.30	207.70	Conference call with I 1 Napoli and E Espinosa
0/07/10	Manage II D. A	0.00	1 777 01	regarding scope of Sh S coverage
9/27/10	Maxwell, B. A.	8.00	1,773.84	Continue to perfe. a privilege review of Retirement
0/07/10	Manali M D	7.00	2 167 50	Value docume. ts Cr production
9/27/10	Napoli, M. D.	7.00	3,167.50	Telephone conference with A Boyer regarding claims again.; prepare
				claims again.; prepare informat on regarding; confer
				with F M ixwell regarding production of
				doc'n ents and privilege review; revise motion to
				cas lidate; prepare text for website and
				communication to investors; telephone conference
				v. th K Kennedy and E Espinosa; revise petition
				against ; confer with E Espinosa regarding
				damage claim; e-mail correspondence
				with M Nielsen; e-mail correspondence with
			0'	counsel and court regarding hearing on fee
				application; review documents regarding claim
				against prepare for hearing on
		Co		fee app
9/28/10	Boyer, A. L.	0.70	278.74	Further review of materials received from M.
	•	7		Napoli including report; review statute and
				applicable case law; revise letter; confer with M.
		O.		Napoli.
9/28/10	Cunningham, 5.	0.90	219.92	Review wage claim from Melinda Guerrero; confer
				with E. Espinosa regarding response; telephone
				conference with representative from the Texas
				Workforce Commission regarding claim and the
				company's address; begin drafting letter in
				response to wage claim and completing Employer's
	. 0			Response form.
9/28/10	Poinosa, E. S.	3.80	1,216.00	Telephone conference with
	70-			,
				telephone conference with E. Cunningham
				regarding M. Guerrero, TWC and change of
				address issues; Review ;
				Review/revise damage calculations; Correspond
				with A. Goldate regarding (investor);
>				telephone conference with A. Merrick and A.
				Cullen regarding mgmt transition, policy MMI860;
				updated medicals and ISC LE's; update premium
				payment tracking spreadsheet and forward to A.

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

	Page. '5
	October 14, 2010
	Invoice: 2273826
<u>iption</u>	
ck	
privilege review o	f Retiren e.∴ Value LL

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u> <u>H</u>	<u>Iours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	Description Merrick
9/28/10	Maxwell, B. A.	3.60	798.23	Finish privilege review of Retirer e Value LLC documents for production; finish diafting Rule 11
9/28/10	Meisel, S.	0.20	No Charge	Agreement regarding confider that you documents Analyze emails from all counsel and James Parsons regarding hearing availability; revise and serve amended hearing notice.
9/28/10	Napoli, M. D.	4.00	1,810.00	Review and revise Tu. 11 agreement regarding confidentiality; c. re-pondence with A Goldate regarding inv. to request; prepare e-mail communic flor with G Weisbart regarding fee application; hew proposal by Platinum for coding; leconference and meeting with M Holms r garding coding project; e-mail correspondence with counsel regarding regarding; e-mail correspondence with K Kennedy regarding; teleconference with G Weisbart regarding fee app and motion to consolidate; research regarding claims against James; e-mail correspondence with G Weisbart regarding motion to consolidate; Teleconference with M Nielsen regarding
9/28/10	Nelson, J. D.	1.70	261.55	Recover mail and check Retirement Value offices; forward mail to E. Espinosa.
9/29/10	Brown, A. G.	ንዲ <u>ን</u>	162.90	Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from investors; conduct research regarding investments in order to respond to investor questions regarding their individual accounts; draft responses to investor requests for information
9/29/10	Cunningham ३.	0.50	122.18	Finalize response to Melinda Guerrero's TWC wage claim; complete wage verification form for Marisa Kane.
9/29/10	Dietel, V.	2.00	696.86	Review and analyze d
9/29/10	Pspinosa, E. S.	6.10	1,952.00	Review damage analysis and transmit same to review draft of letter; review B. Collins' "open letter"; consult with A. Merrick and M. Napoli regarding ISC - LE's without medical update; consult with M. Napoli and A. Goldate regarding reconcile production with KPK&F QB records; address M. Guerrero and E. Cunningham; consult with M. Napoli regarding reconciliation of medical records; extension to RV's acquisition of policies; consult

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

.	1 (4)	TT	A a 4	Description
<u>Date</u>	Attorney	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	<u>Description</u> with A. Merrick regarding ASG involves;
				telephone conference with S. Naster L. Coit Capital
9/29/10	Napoli, M. D.	6.50	2,941.25	Analysis of claims agains and
				t; correspondence with M Nielsen
				regarding confidentiality; a leconference with A
				Goldate regarding ; e_nail correspondence with A Goldate regarding sales;
				teleconference with A. Ierrick and E Espinosa
				regarding insured with no updated medicals;
				analysis of clanes against;
				correspond nce with A Goldate and K Kennedy
				regarding; review
				amage calculation and memo to
				onfer with E Espinosa regarding claims
				agains.; review
	~	0.00	40.72	law
9/29/10	Sanchez, J. R.	0.30 0.80	40.73 144.80	Propare documents for document production. Conduct and respond to telephone inquiries from
9/30/10	Brown, A. G.	0.80	144,00	investors; conduct research regarding investments
				in order to respond to investor questions regarding
			•	their individual accounts; draft responses to
			40.	investor requests for information
9/30/10	Espinosa, E. S.	5.70	1,874.00	Review Draf pleading, consult with M.
				Napoli regarding comments to same; consult with
		1,6		A. Merrick regarding ASG invoicing; Review
				Gray's application for October expenses; consult with M. Napoli and B. Cunningham regarding
				same; consult with M. Napoli and A. Brown
		4.0.		regarding A. Thornton; Reconcile T&C Nichols
				and S. Pool ledger and address various accounting
				issues in Quickbooks.
9/30/10	Napoli, M. P	4.00	1,810.00	Research claims against
	0,			review Gray budget certification; e-mail
				correspondence with E Cunningham regarding
				Gray unemployment compensation; prepare
				analysis of sales by licensees; e-mail to E Espinosa regarding same; confer with E Espinosa regarding
				petition; e-mail correspondence with A
	O			Goldate regarding
9/30,10	Sanchez, J. R.	3.60	488.70	Load "selling licensee" and "amount sold" coding
	, .			to Ringtail database; Conference with M. Napoli
				regarding document searches and RV production;
				Prepare documents for production.

407.70

Page: 15 October 14, 23 J Invoice: 2273826

Matter: State of Texas vs. Retirement Value LLC, et. al. Client/Matter #: 1203981.00001

Page: 17 October 14, 201 J Invoice: 2273826

TIMEKEEPER SUI	MMARY			
<u>Timekeeper</u>		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kirby, R.A.	Discounted 10%	0.30	692.33	207.70
Napoli, M. D.	Discounted 10%	122.10	45, 50	55,250.25
Boyer, A. L.	Discounted 10%	1.30	39ა.20	517.66
Dietel, K.	Discounted 10%	46.70	348.43	16,271.70
Espinosa, E. S.	(Discounted Flat-Rate)	139.20	320.00	44,544.00
Brunswick, L. G.	Discounted 10%	2.90	307.70	892.33
Dotson, J. R.	Discounted 10%	3.50	307.70	1,076.95
Meisel, S.	Discounted 10%	2.00	307.70	615.40
Frazier, K.	Discounted 10%	0.40	294.13	117.65
Cunningham, E.	Discounted 10%	4.30	244.35	1,050.73
Jo, S. S.	Discounted 10%	12.60	221.73	2,793.79
Maxwell, B. A.	Discounted 10%	16.30	221.73	3,569.85
Wilkerson, P.	Discounted 10%	5.40	185.53	1,001.88
Brown, A. G.	Discounted 10%	. 8.00	181.00	3,258.00
Stephens, B.L.	Discounted 10%	2.80	171.95	481.46
Nelson, J. D.	Discounted 10%	3.50	153.85	538.48
Sanchez, J. R.	Discounted 10%	22.80	135.75	3,095.12
,		1		
Total for All Timeke	epers	407.70	\$331.82	\$135,282.95

INVOICE TOTAL

X	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>	<u>Total</u>
Prior Outstanding Balance Due	801,795.94	0.00	801,795.94
urrent Charges	135,282.95	0.00	135,282.95
Net Balance	937,078.89	0.00	937,078.89
TOTAL	BALANCE DUE TH	IIS MATTER	\$937,078.89

PAYMENT DUE IN FULL ON OR BEFORE NOVEMBER 13, 2010

Junical Collins of the State of

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gates ter 1717 Main Street Suits 2800 Dallas, TX 752D1

1 214.939.5500

www.kigates.nor.

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DO NOT DISCLOSE

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC c/o Eddy Espinosa
K&L Gates, LLP
1717 Main Street
Suite 2800
Dallas, TX 75201

October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273827 Matter Desc David & Elizabeth Gray Clicno Aatter #: 1203981,00003

This statement covers fees for legal services rendered and express incurred for your account during the period ending 09/30/2010. Detailed information regarding the sees and expenses is attached.

Current Charges:

Fees

1,111.36

Total Current Charge

\$1,111.36

PAYMENT FOR "CURRENT ANOUNT" IS DUE IN FULL ON OR BEFORE NOVEMBER 13, 2010

Please Return a Copy of This Page With Your Payment to the Pittsburgh Office at 210 Sixth Avenue, Pittsburgh, PA 15222-2613 Attn: Accounts Receivable Department or Reference Invoice: 2273827

Payment Can Also be Made by wire to: The Bank of New York Mellon, ABA Routing Number: 043000261, Account # 127-2657, K&L Gates, AIS Account, Reference Invoice 2273827

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&I. Gutes LIP 1717 Main Street Sulte 2800 Dellas, TX 75201

1 214.939.5500

www.kigates.com.

October 14, 2010 Invoice: 2273827

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL DO NOT DISCLOSE

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC c/o Eddy Espinosa
K&L Gates, LLP
1717 Main Street
Suite 2800
Dallas, TX 75201

X 13201

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RECORDED AS CF 39/30/10:

Matter: 1203981.00003

Matter Description: David & Elizabeth Gray

Date	Attorney	Hours	Amount	Lescription
8/12/10	Dietel, K.	0.80	278.74	Review claim against Gray
				defendants
9/13/10	Dietel, K.	1.50	5. 2.6.	Confer with M. Napoli regarding service of petition on
				Defendants; review correspondence to clerk regarding
			69	same; draft Amended Original Petition
9/13/10	Napoli, M. D.	0.30	135.75	Review public records report on defendants; review
)	and revise amended petition; consider alternative
- 4. 44				service of process
9/14/10	Dietel, K.	0.50	174.22	Coordinate filing of Amended Petition and request for
				reissuance of citations for Defendants for service
				through Texas Secretary of State

TOTAL HOURS

3.10

TOTAL FOR SERVICES

\$1,111.36

TIMFK SAPER SUMMARY <u>Timekeaper</u>	<u> Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
I 'po'i, M. D. Netel, K.	0.30 2.80	452.50 348.43	135.75 975.61
Total for All Timekeepers	3.10	\$358.50	\$1,111.36

INVOICE TOTAL

Matter: David & Elizabeth Gray Client/Matter #: 1203981.00003

Current Charges

Pagr. 7 October 14, 200 Invoice: 2273827

 Fees
 Expenses
 Total

 1,111.36
 0.00
 1,111.36

TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS MATTER

\$1,111.36

JRE NOVEA PAYMENT DUE IN FULL ON OR BEFORE NOVEMPCR 13, 2010 Judicia con Hais Opistic Contraits Opistic Contr

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gatos LLP 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

1 206.623.7580

www.kigates.con.

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 2250585

Julie Arme Jalter

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2010:

1203981.70001 State of Texas vs Retirement Value LLC, et. a - e DAT Fees

Fee Amount		7,651.50
Less 9.5% Discount to Fees	• , ()	(726.89)
Net Fees		6,924.61
Disbursement Amount		580.30

Total Amount Due This M. 'te'

7,504.91

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gatos up 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

T 206.623.7580

www.kigates.oc.

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 12,6585

Page

Julie Anne Halter

1203981

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC

1203981.70001

State of Texas vs Retirement Value LLC, et. al. F. DAT Fees

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2010

Da	ite	Atty	Hours	Amount	Description of Services
08/10	/10	JAH	0.30	154.50	Review a. I respond to email from E. Espinosa regarding Accumyn forensic consulting work; on w up with M. Goodfried regarding commencement of issue analysis project
08/18	/10	BAM	0.50	122.50	Conference with Mr. Napoli and Ms. Frazier regarding document review
08/19	/10	SSJ	1.40	3. 3.0	Conference with Mr. Napoli and Ms. Frazier regarding document review
08/20	/10	JAH	0.60	31,9.00	Conference with M. Napoli regarding commencement of e-DAT review project; follow up regarding key issue list and privilege issues associated with same
08/20	/10	SSJ	_ 70	906.50	Conference call with Mr. Napoli and Mr. Halter regarding document review; draft memorandum on background information for document reviewers
08/23	/10	JAH).40	206.00	Coordinate with R. Sanchez and B. Stephens regarding Issue Analysis codes and accessibility in litigation support database; follow up regarding same
08/24	/10	KD	2.00	770.00	Review Memorandum regarding background information for e-DAT document review and prepare for conference call with e-DAT team; conference call with M. Napoli and e-DAT document review team regarding receivership
03/24	/10	SSJ	1.50	367.50	Conference call with Mr. Napoli regarding document review issues
08/24	/10	YMBG	1.50	465.00	Coordinate and oversee review of documents in

Tax ID No. 25 0821018

K&L Gates LIP 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

r 206.623.7580

www.kigates.os.

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 1256585 Page

Julie Anne Halter

	Date	Atty	Hours	Amount	Description of Services preparation for production
08,	/25/10	JAH	0.30	154.50	Oversee and supervice ament review and production effort acluding review of and response to email regarding amous reviewer questions
08,	/26/10	YMBG	2.30	713.00	Coordinate and versee review of documents for production; a does relevancy and privilege issues to M. Nap h
08,	/27/10	JAH	0.40	206.00	Review and evaluate results of culling effort for W. Roger's les; review and respond to email regraing same
08.	/27/10	YMBG	1.50	465.00	Condinate and oversee review of documents for production; address relevancy issues to M. Napoli
08,	/30/10	YMBG	3.00	930.0(Coordinate and oversee review of documents for production; address case status and collections issues to M. Napoli; conduct review of JPG and WAV files to determine potential responsiveness
08,	/30/10	JAH	0.40	206.00	Conference with M. Napoli regarding treatment of W. Rogers hard drive collection files and plan for addressing same
08,	/31/10	YMBG	30	1,333.00	Coordinate and oversee review of documents for production; conduct review of JPG and WAV files for production to determine potential responsiveness

 Total Fees:
 7,651.50

 Total Adjustment
 (726.89)

 Net Fees
 6,924.61

K&L Gates cor 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

7 206,623,7580

www.kigates.co..

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 22,6585 Page 4

Julie Anne Halter

Disbursements	Amount	
Copying Expense	20,00	
ESI Conversion: Convert 10266 pages to TIFF images	535.30	
@ \$0.05/page: \$513.30; OCR 1100 pages @	353.30	
\$0.02/page: \$22.00		
SD BOM Erranges	25.00	
CD ROM Expenses	23.00	#00.20
CD ROM Expenses Total Disbursements:		580.30
Current Charges		8,231.80
Less 9.5% Discount to Foos		(726.89)
Total Amount Due This Bil		7,504.91
Total Navy Due		7,504.91
		.,
0		
O		

Judicial contrains of the state of the state

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&1 Gates to 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

T 206.623.7680

www.kdgates.ce:

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 2259807

Julie Anne Haiter

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2010:

1203981,70001 State of Texas vs Retirement Value LLC, et. 2. - 6 DAT Fees

 Fee Amount
 36,527.90

 Less 9.5% Discount to Fees
 (176.56)

 Net Fees
 36,351.34

 Disbursement Amount
 362.51

Total Amount Due This Matte

36,713.85

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

K&L Gates up 925 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

1 206.623,7580

www.ldgates.com

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010

Invoice Number: 1203807

Page

Julie Anne Haner

1203981

The Estate of Retirement Value, LLC

1203981.70001

State of Texas vs Retirement Value LLC, et. al. - - DAT Fees

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2010

Date	Atty	Hours	Amount	Descriptic (o. Services
09/01/10	JAH	0.40	206.00	Oversee a. 'I supervise review and production effort including review of and response to email regarding your varieties.
09/01/10	YMBG	1.50	465.00	Cc dinate and oversee review of documents for production including review of and response to review team member questions
09/03/10	YMBG	1.00	31 0.00	Coordinate and oversee review of documents for production including review of and response to review team member questions
09/03/10	JAH	0.30	154.50	Oversee and supervise document review and production effort including review of and response to email regarding various issues
09/07/10	YMBG	. 50	465.00	Coordinate and oversee review of documents for production; address case status to J. Halter
09/08/10	YMBG	0.50	155.00	Coordinate and oversee review and processing of documents for production
09/13/10	JAF	0.20	103.00	Email communication with M. Napoli regarding review status and questions associated with next steps for W. Rogers hard drive material
09/30/10	CSI Legal Review	N/A	34,669.40	Initial review @ rate of \$22.50/MB; 1,540.86 MB reviewed; Total Charges \$34,669.40

 Total Fees:
 36,527.90

 Total Adjustment
 (176.56)

 Net Fees
 36,351.34

K&L Gates ur 926 Fourth Avenue Suite 2900 Seattle, WA 98104-1158

Tax ID No. 25 0921018

T 206.623.7580

www.kigates.cc

c/o Eduardo S. Espinosa, Receiver 1717 Main Street, Suite 2800 Dallas, TX 75201 October 19, 2010 Invoice Number: 2259807

Page

Julie Anne Haiter

Disbursements BSI Conversion: OCR 1646 pages @ \$0.02/page (\$32.92): \$32.92 BSI Conversion: Load 0.599248047 GB for review	Amount 32.92	
\$550/GB (\$329.59): \$329.59	525.55	
Total Disbursements:		362.51
Current Charges		36,890.41
Less 9.5% Discount to Rees		(176.56)
Total Amount Due This Bul		36,713.85
To fal How Due		36,713.85
TC at 1 OW Due		20,713.03